EXHIBIT “A”
LABORATORY BID COMPARISON

EST. NO. MICROBIOL | BIOSCREEN | ENVIRON
SMPLES PER OGICAL TESTING MENTAL | MICHELSON SILLIKER CLINICAL

CONSTITUENT YEAR SERVICES SERVICES LABS LABS LABS WECK LABS |LABS

UNIT COST UNIT COST |UNIT COST| UNIT COST | UNIT COST | UNIT COST | UNIT COST
TOTAL COLIFORM 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 850 $ 25.00 | $ 10.00
FECAL COLIFORM 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 850|$ 10.00 | $ 10.00
PLATE COUNT 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 98213 15.00 | $ 8.00
ENTEROCOCCUS 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 9.82 1% 40.00 | $ 20.00
DAILY SAMPLE PICKUP 365 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $ 6.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 20.00
LAB UNIT COST TOTAL $ 4264 $ 115.00 $ 68.00
LAB ANNUAL COST TOTAL $ 29,206.40 $ 59,925.00 $ 35,700.00




