EXHIBIT “A”
LABORATORY BID COMPARISON

NO. ADVANCED MONTGOMERY| WEST COAST
SAMPLES | MICHELSON| TECHNOLOGY WATSON ANALYTICAL CLINICAL
CONSTITUENT PER LABS LABS WECK LABS| HARZA LABS SERVICES LABS EMAX LABS
YEAR UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST

Total/fecal Coliforn as needed | $ 12.00 | $ 25.00 | $ 25.00 NO BID NO BID $ 20.00 NO BID
Plate Count as needed | $ 9.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID NO BID $ 8.00 NO BID
COD 52 $ 21.00| $ 20.00 | $ 25.00 NO BID $ 2500 | $ 25.00 NO BID
TSS 52 $ 10.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID $ 20.00 | $ 20.00 NO BID
TDS 200 $ 10.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID $ 20.00 | $ 18.00 NO BID
pH 70 $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 | $ 5.00 NO BID $ 10.00 | $ 5.00 NO BID
Chloride 140 $ 10.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID $ 75.00 | $ 10.00 NO BID
Iron 140 $ 10.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID $ 35.00 | $ 10.00 NO BID
Manganese 140 $ 10.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 15.00 NO BID $ 35.00 | $ 10.00 NO BID
Sample pickup charge (weekly) 52 $ 500 | $ - $ 25.00 NO BID $ 25.00 | $ - NO BID
LAB UNIT COST TOAL $ 102.00 $ 113.00 $ 170.00 $ - $ 245.00 $ 126.00 -
LAB ANNUAL COST TOTAL $ 8,443.00 $ 7,291.00 $ 13,070.00 $ 28,640.00 $ 10,518.00

* Bottle delivery and sample pickup location in Torrance




