2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

Hydrated Lime

CHEMICAL/LOCATION

Projected Use

Hydrated lime
ECLWRF

Tons/day
5

Tonslyear
1,825

VENDOR/EST TOTAL UNIT PRICE/
CHEM. USE TOTAL COST PER BID
Brenntag Pacific No bid No bid
Standard Lime $ 182 | $§ 332,150
Chemical Lime $ 171 | $ 312,075
Univar No bid No bid




WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

Hydrogen Peroxide

VENDOR/EST TOTAL UNIT PRICE/
CHEMICAL/LOCATION | Projected Use CHEM. USE TOTAL COST PER BID
Hydrogen peroxide gpd gpy |Thatcher $ 4050| $ 59,130.00
ECLWRF 40 14,600 |Pacifica Chemical $ 4480 | $ 65,408.00
U.S. Peroxide $ 4710 | $ 68,766.00
Brenntag $ 4.025| $ 58,765.00
Univar $ 4721 | % 68,926.60




WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT
2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

Sodium Bisulfite

CHEMICAL/LOCATION

Projected Use

VENDOR/EST TOTAL
CHEM. USE

UNIT PRICE/
TOTAL COST PER BID

Sodium Bisulfite
Chevron

Mobil

CRWRP

dry pounds
176,400
187,200
96,000

Vendor: JCI Jones

Chevron $0.269 | $ 47,451.60
Mobil $0.269 $ 50,356.80
CRWRP $0.269 | $ 25,824.00
Total for 1 year $ 123,632.40
BCS

Chevron $0.3026 | $ 53,378.64
Mobil $0.3026 | $ 56,646.72
CRWRP $0.3026 | $ 29,049.60
Total for 1 year $ 139,074.96




WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

Sodium Hydroxide

CHEMICAL/LOCATION

Projected Use

VENDOR/EST TOTAL
CHEM. USE

UNIT PRICE/

TOTAL COST PER BID

Sodium hydroxide-Fixed Pricing dry pounds |Vendor: Olin Chlor Alkali
Chevron 517,942 Chevron No bid
Mobil 457,527 Mobil No bid
CRWRP 88,528 CRWRP No bid
Total for 1 year No bid
Vendor: JCI Jones
Chevron 3 0.2790
Mobil $ 0.2790
CRWRP $ 0.399
Total for 1 year $ 307,478.52
Vendor: Brenntag
Chevron $ 0.225
Mobil $ 0.225
CRWRP $ 0.225
Total for 1 year $ 239,399.33
Vendor: Basic Chemical
Chevron $ 0.2299
Mobil $ 0.2299
CRWRP $ 0.3025
Total for 1 year $ 251,040.04
Vendor: PVS Minibulk
Chevron $ 0.3600
Mobil $ 0.3600
CRWRP $ 0.8600
Total for 1 year $ 427,302.92
Vendor: Univar
Chevron $ 0.2245
Mobil $ 0.2245
CRWRP $ 0.2245
Total for 1 year $ ¢ 238,867.33




WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT

2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

Sodium Hypochlorite

CHEMICAL/LOCATION

Projected Use

VENDOR/EST TOTAL
CHEM. USE

UNIT PRICE/
TOTAL COST PER BID

Sodium hypochlorite
ECLWREF (short load)
Chevron

Mobil

CRWRP

gpd gpy
3620 | 1,321,300
480 175,200
990 361,350
530 193,450

Vendor: Olin Chlor Alkali

ECLWREF (short load) $ 0.500
Chevron $ 0.499
Mobil 3 0.500
CRWRP $ 0.500
Total for 1 year $ 1,025,474.80
Vendor: HASA
ECLWRF $ 0.701
Chevron $ 0.701
Mobil $ 0.701
CRWRP $ 0.701
Total for 1 year $ 1,437,961.30
Vendor: Basic Chemical
ECLWRF $ 0.778
Chevron $ 0.778
Mobil $ 0.778
CRWRP $ 0.778
Total for 1 year $ 1,595,911.40
Vendor: JCI Jones
ECLWRF $ 0.4775
Chevron $ 0.4775
Mobil $ 0.4775
CRWRP $ 0.4775
Total for 1 year $ 979,495.75
Vendor: Univar
ECLWRF No Bid
Chevron No Bid
Mobil No Bid
CRWRP ¢ No Bid




WEST BASIN MUNICIPAL WATER DISTRICT
2010-11 CHEMICAL SUPPLY/DELIVERY BID SUMMARY

Sulfuric Acid

CHEMICAL/LOCATION

Projected Use

VENDOR/EST TOTAL
CHEM. USE

UNIT PRICE/
TOTAL COST PER BID

Sulfuric acid
ECLWRF

ECLWREF (short load)
Mobil

CRWRP

Tons/mo
275
8
3.3
55

Tonslyr
3,300

39.6
66

Vendor: Brenntag

ECLWRF $ 130.00
ECLWREF (short load) $ 154.80
Mobil $ 154.80
CRWRP 3 154.80
Total for 1 year $ 445,346.88
Vendor: Univar
ECLWRF No Bid
ECLWREF (short load) No Bid
Mobil No Bid
CRWRP No Bid
Vendor: Basic Chemical
ECLWRF $ 123.65
ECLWREF (short load) $ 123.65
Mobil 3 123.65
CRWRP $ 123.65
Total for 1 year $ 421,102.44
Vendor: PVS Minibulk
ECLWRF $ 159.00
ECLWREF (short load) $ 320.00
Mobil $ 255.00
CRWRP $ 165.00
Total for 1 year $ 545,688.00
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